Vendor Name:	Earthgrains
Prompt payment discount percentage:	
Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):	

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
Bread, Sliced							
Bread, potato bread (no flour content)					No bid		
Bread, round top, white	Colonial	22 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.10		
Bread, round top, white wheat	Sara Lee	18 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.24		
Bread, round top, wheat	Sara Lee	18 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.21		
Bread, round top, whole wheat	Sara Lee	18 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.21		
Bread, sandwich loaf, white	Colonial/ Sunbeam	22 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.10		
Bread, sandwich loaf, white wheat					No bid		
Bread, sandwich loaf, wheat	Colonial	22 slices	1	20 oz	\$ 1.21		
Bread, sandwich loaf, whole wheat					No bid		
Bread, texas toast, white	Colonial	17 slices	1	24 oz	\$ 1.18		
24 count Small buns sheet (Similar to White Caslte size)	Colonial	24	1	24 oz	\$ 2.13		
4" Hamburger Buns, Sliced							
8 count pack	Colonial (3.5")	8	1	13 oz	\$ 0.75		
1 dozen pack	Colonial	12	1	22 oz	\$ 1.17		
30 count buns	Colonial	30	1	60 oz	\$ 2.90		
4" Hamburger Buns. Onion, Sliced							
8 count pack					No bid		

Vendor Name:	Earthgrains
Prompt payment discount percentage:	
Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):	

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack		Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
1 dozen pack					No bid		
Tray Pack					No bid		
4" Hamburger Buns, Potato, Sliced							
8 count pack					No bid		
1 dozen pack					No bid		
Tray Pack					No bid		
4" Hamburger Buns, Wheat, Sliced							
8 count pack	Sara Lee	8	1	12 oz	\$ 0.88		
1 dozen pack					No Bid		
30 count buns					No Bid		
4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced							
8 count pack	Sara Lee (3.75")	8	1	21 oz	\$ 1.16		
1 dozen pack					No bid		
30 count buns					No bid		
Hot Dog Buns, Sliced							
8 count pack	Colonial	8	1	12 0z	\$ 0.77		
1 dozen pack	Sunny	12	1	18 oz	\$ 1.17		
24 count pack					No bid		
Tray of 5 dozen					No bid		

Vendor Name:	Earthgrains
Prompt payment discount percentage:	
Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):	

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
Hot Dog Buns, Wheat, Sliced							
8 count pack	Sara Lee	8	1	12 0z	\$ 0.90		
1 dozen pack					No bid		
24 count pack							
Tray of 5 dozen							
Hot Dog Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced							
8 count pack	Sara Lee	8	1	12 oz	\$ 0.90		
1 dozen pack					No bid		
24 count pack					No bid		
Tray of 5 dozen					No bid		
Steak Bun (Hoagie style)							
8 count	Sara Lee	6	1	16 oz	\$ 1.16		
24 count	Colonial	24	1	56 oz	\$ 4.32		
Steak Bun, Wheat (Hoagie style)							
8 count					No bid		
24 count					No bid		
Steak Bun, Whole Wheat (Hoagie style)							
8 count					No bid		
24 count					No bid		
Miscellaneous							

Vendor Name:	Earthgrains
Prompt payment discount percentage:	
Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):	

Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Pric	e	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving
5 ½" sesame seed Slim Jim Bun	Sara Lee	6	1	16 oz	\$	1.25		
Brown n Serve Rolls 12 pack	Colonial	12	1	12 oz	\$	0.90		
Donuts - Individual Pkg Chocolate					No bid			
Donuts - Individual Pkg Powdered					No bid			
Garlic Bread Stick (no less than 1 oz)					No bid			
Bread Stick (no less than 1 oz)					No bid			
K & K Buns (Dinner Rolls) 1 dz package	Sara Lee	12	1	16 oz	\$	1.16		
Kaiser Roll					No bid			
Stale Bread (also known as "day old" bread)					No bid			
Whole Wheat Bagels					No bid			
Whole Wheat Dinner Rolls					No bid			
Please List Additional Items You Wish To Bid Below:								
Whole Grain White Hot Dog	Sara Lee	8	1	12 oz	\$	0.90		
Whole Grain White Hamburger	Sara Lee	8	1	12 oz	\$	0.90		

Vendor Name:	Earthgrains						
Prompt payment discount percentage: Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):							
Many districts are applying for the Federal USI Whole grain breads must be stock items. Pro	vide the nutri	-	h item bid. V		_	•	•
Item Description	Brand	#Qty per pack	# to make single serving	Weight per pack	Bid Price	Sugar Content Per Serving	Fat Content Per Serving