Vendor Name:

Borden Dairy Co. Cincinnati (fka Meyer Dair

>|/)

Prompt payment discount percentage:

0.0%

Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):

Provide nutritional

label information for each item bid.

With Coolers Without Coolers
Escalator Price Escalator Price
Firm Firm
ITEM DESCRIPTION Price Regulated| Vendor Price Regulated | Vendor csol;%srr,t Coii[ant
Price Markup Price Markup per Per
6/1/2012 6/1/2012 serving Serving

% pint fat free skim white milk, plastic container 0.2495 0.2445 0.2445 0.2395 12 0
% pint low fat white milk (1% or less), plastic container 0.258 0.253 0.253 0.248 12 1
% pint whole white milk, plastic container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12 8
% pint fat free skim chocolate, plastic container 0.2594 0.2544 0.2544 0.2494 21 0
% pint fat free skim strawberry, plastic container 0.2508 0.2458 0.2458 0.2408 22 0
pint fat free skim white milk, plastic container 0.79 0.79 0.79 0.79 12 0
pint 1% white milk, plastic container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pint whole white milk, plastic container 0.79 0.79 0.79 0.79 12 8
pint fat free skim chocolate milk, plastic container 0.79 0.79 0.79 0.79 21 0
pint fat free skim strawberry milk, plastic container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon fat free buttermilk, plastic container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon 2% lowfat buttermilk, plastic container 1.799 1.799 1.799 1.799 12 5
% gallon whole buttermilk, plastic container 1.799 1.799 1.799 1.799 12 8
% gallon soy milk, plastic container No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon fat free skim white milk, plastic container 2.97 2.97 2.97 2.97 12 0
1 gallon 1% white milk, plastic container 3.12 3.12 3.12 3.12 12 2.5
1 gallon 2% white milk, plastic container 3.08 3.08 3.08 3.08 12 5
1 gallon whole white milk, plastic container 3.15 3.15 3.15 3.15 12 8
8 oz fat free white milk, plastic vending machine Item 0.2495 0.2445 0.2445 0.2395 12 0
8 oz fat free chocolate milk, plastic vending machine Item 0.2594 0.2544 0.2544 0.2494 21 0
8 oz fat free strawberry milk, plastic vending machine Item 0.2508 0.2458 0.2458 0.2408 22 0
8 0z 1% white milk, plastic vending machine Item 0.258 0.253 0.253 0.248 12 2.5
10 oz fat free white milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 oz fat free chocolate milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 oz fat free strawberry milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




With Coolers Without Coolers
Escalator Price Escalator Price
Firm Firm
ITEM DESCRIPTION Price Regulated| Vendor Price Regulated| Vendor CSc;?:rrnt Can?;nt
Price Markup Price Markup per Per
6/1/2012 6/1/2012 serving Serving

10 oz 1% white milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 oz fat free white milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 oz fat free chocolate milk, plastic vending machine ltem No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 oz fat free strawberry milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 oz 1% white milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 oz fat free white milk, plastic vending machine Item 0.79 0.79 0.79 0.79 12 0
16 oz fat free chocolate milk, plastic vending machine ltem 0.79 0.79 0.79 0.79 21 0
16 oz fat free strawberry milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 0z 1% white milk, plastic vending machine Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% pint fat free skim white milk, carton 0.189 0.184 0.184 0.179 12 0
% pint low fat white milk (1% or less), carton 0.189 0.184 0.184 0.179 12 2.5
% pint whole white milk, carton 0.214 0.209 0.209 0.204 12 8
% pint chocolate fat free, carton 0.2034 0.1984 0.1984 0.1934 21 0
% pint strawberry fat free, carton 0.2085 0.2035 0.2035 0.1985 22 0
pint fat free skim white milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pint low fat white milk (1% or less), carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pint whole white milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pint chocolate fat free, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
pint strawberry fat free, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon whole buttermilk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon soy milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon 2% low — fat milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon fat free buttermilk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% gallon 2% lowfat buttermilk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon 2% low — fat milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon — whole milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon - skim milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon - 1% lowfat milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon - fat free milk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon fat free buttermilk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon 2% lowfat buttermilk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 gallon whole buttermilk, carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




With Coolers

Without Coolers

Escalator Price Escalator Price
Firm Firm
ITEM DESCRIPTION Price Regulated| Vendor Price Regulated| Vendor CSc;?:rrnt Can?;nt
Price Markup Price Markup per Per
6/1/2012 6/1/2012 serving Serving

4 oz cottage cheese (low fat 1%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Ib. cottage cheese (low fat 1%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Ib. cottage cheese (low fat 1%) 7.45 7.45 7.45 7.45 4 1
Individual sour cream No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 Ib. sour cream (low fat) 6.61 6.61 6.61 6.61 1 3
Yogurt Lowfat No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36 2.5
9 oz Drinkable Yogurt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 fluid oz. fruit juice — apple (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
4 fluid oz. fruit juice — fruit punch (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
4 fluid oz. fruit juice — grape (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
4 fluid oz. fruit juice — orange (100 %) 0.156 0.156 0.156 0.156 21 0
6.75 fluid oz. fruit juice — apple (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
6.75 fluid oz. fruit juice — fruit punch (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
6.75 fluid oz. fruit juice — grape (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
6.75 fluid oz. fruit juice — orange (100 %) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
6.75 fluid oz. Juice Pac 100% Juices (4 flavors) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% pint fruit juice — apple (100%), carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
% pint fruit juice — fruit punch (100%), carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
% pint fruit juice — grape (100%), carton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
% pint fruit juice — orange (100 %), carton 0.259 0.259 0.259 0.259 21 0
pint fruit juice — apple (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
pint fruit juice — fruit punch (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
pint fruit juice — grape (100%) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid [No Bid
pint fruit juice — orange (100 %) 0.89 0.89 0.89 0.89 21 0
Shake mix — Vanilla 2.55 2.55 2.55 2.55 15 3.5
Shake mix — Chocolate No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 oz. Hershey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 oz. Nestle Quik chocolate (1% or Less) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 oz. Nestle Quik strawberry (1% or Less) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 oz bottled water No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 oz bottled water No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 oz bottled water No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




With Coolers

Without Coolers

Escalator Price

Escalator Price

Firm Firm
ITEM DESCRIPTION Price Regulated| Vendor Price Regulated| Vendor CSc;?:rrnt Can?;nt
Price Markup Price Markup per Per
6/1/2012 6/1/2012 serving Serving
pintice tea 0.79 0.79 0.79 0.79 23 0
gallon ice tea 1.95 1.95 1.95 1.95 23 0
quart soy milk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
% pint lactose-free milk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
guart lactose-free milk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rice milk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
dozen eggs market market market market No Bid No Bid
Straws 46.5 46.5 46.5 46.5 n/a n/a

Lactose Free and Soy Milk Products-Please List

Other Products
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